
Half Day – 5.5 miles

Discover the beauty of the River Wye 
on our popular half-day canoeing trip. 
Experience thrilling twists, gentle 
rapids, and enchanting wildlife as you 
paddle along. Our journey starts in 
picturesque village of Glasbury and 
ends in the renowned town of books, 
Hay-on-Wye. Prepare for a refreshing 
adventure that will leave you with 
lasting memories.

Full Day – 11.5 miles

Embark on a captivating full-day 
canoeing adventure along the 
majestic River Wye. Starting in scenic 
Glasbury, you’ll navigate through the 
famous town of books, Hay-on-Wye. 
Enjoy a delightful lunch break before 
continuing your journey into the English 
countryside, concluding at Whitney-
on-Wye. Rest and rejuvenate at a 
charming riverside pub, as we arrange 
your comfortable return. Immerse 
yourself in nature, bask in the sun, and 
let us take care of the rest.

Camping Expeditions

From the foot of the black mountains 
through the heart of the golden valley, 
our multi-day canoeing trips allow 
you to explore every bit of stunning 
scenery that the incredible River Wye 
has to offer.
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